
Section
1.

2.

3.

4.

5.

6.

7.

8.

9.

10.

11.

12.

13.

14.

15.

16.

17.

18.

19.

20.

Oireachtas Library

54023001287496

w

AN BILLE LEASA SHOISIALAIGH, 1972 
SOCIAL WELFARE BILL, 1972

Mar a tugadh isteach 
As introduced

ARRANGEMENT OF SECTIONS 

Interpretation.

Increase of rates of old age pensions.

Increase of rates of unemployment assistance.

Increase of certain rates of unemployment benefit.

Increase of rates of widows’ (non-contributory) pensions.

Increase of rates of orphans’ (non-contributory) pensions.

Amendment of section 6 of Act of 1952.

Amendment of section 26 (4) of Act of 1952.

Amendment of section 47 of Act of 1952.

Amendment of section 58 of Act of 1952.

Amendment of section 77 (5) of Act of 1952.

Amendment of Second Schedule to Act of 1952.

Amendment of Third Schedule to Act of 1952.

Amendment of Fourth Schedule to Act of 1952.

Amendments relating to the extension of certain provisions of 
Act of 1952 to members of Garda Sioch&na.

Restriction of section 13 of Act of 1966 and of certain regula­
tions under section 32 of Act of 1952.

Amendment of Social Welfare (Occupational Injuries) Act, 
1966.

Amendment of section 21 (1) of Act of 1970.

Amendment of section 22 (1) of Act of 1970.

Short title, construction and collective citation.

[No. 11 of 1972]



Interpretation. 

1935, No. 29.

1952, No. 11.

1966, No. 24.

1968, No. 31.

1969, No. 19.

1970, No. 12.

1971, No. 16.

Increase of rates of 
old age pensions.

1964, No. 28.

AN BILLE LEASA SHOISIALAIGH, 1972 
SOCIAL WELFARE BILL, 1972

BILL
entitled

AN ACT TO AMEND AND EXTEND THE OLD AGE 5 
PENSIONS ACTS, 1908 TO 1971, THE UNEMPLOYMENT 
ASSISTANCE ACTS, 1933 TO 1971, THE WIDOWS’ AND 
ORPHANS’ PENSIONS ACTS, 1935 TO 1971, AND THE 
SOCIAL WELFARE ACTS, 1952 TO 1971.

BE IT ENACTED BY THE OIREACHTAS AS FOLLOWS: 10

1.—In this Act—

“the Act of 1935 ” means the Widows’ and Orphans’ Pensions Act.
1935;

“ the Act of 1952 ” means the Social Welfare Act, 1952;

“the Act of 1966” means the Social Welfare (Miscellaneous Pro* 15 
visions) Act, 1966;

“the Act of 1968” means the Social Welfare (Miscellaneous Pro­
visions) Act, 1968;

“ the Act of 1969 ” means the Social Welfare (Miscellaneous Pro­
visions) Act, 1969; 20

“ the Act of 1970 ” means the Social Welfare Act, 1970;

“the Act of 1971 ” means the Social Welfare Act, 1971.

2.—(1) Section 77 of the Act of 1952 is hereby amended by—

(a) the substitution of “ two hundred and seventy-three pounds ”
for “ two hundred and sixty pounds ” in each place where 25 
it occurs in subsection (2) (inserted by the Social Welfare 
(Miscellaneous Provisions) Act, 1964),

(b) the substitution of “ two hundred and sixty pounds ” for
“ two hundred and forty-seven pounds ” in that sub­
section, 30

(c) the substitution of “ fifty new pence ” for “ forty new pence ”
in that subsection,

(d) the substitution for the Table (inserted by the Act of 1971)
to that subsection of the Table to this subsection, and

(e) the substitution of “ three pounds ” for “ fifty-five shillings ” 35
in paragraph (a) of subsection (5) (inserted by the Act of 
1969).

2



TABLE 

Rate of Pension

Weekly Rates

Means of claimant Claimant or Claimant or Claimant or
or pensioner pensioner, pensioner, pensioner,

no qualified one qualified two or more
child child qualified children

(1) (2) (3) (4)

£ £ £
Where the yearly means

of the claimant or
pensioner as duly cal-
culated—

are Nil........................... 5-15 6-30 7-45'

exceed Nil but do not
exceed £26-25 .. 4-90 6-05 7-20

exceed £26-25 but do not
exceed £52-50 .. 4-65 5-80 6-95

exceed £52-50 but do not
exceed £65-50 .. 4-40 5-55 6-70

exceed £65-50 but do not
exceed £78-50 .. 4-15 5-30 6-45

exceed £78-50 but do not
exceed £104-75 3-90 5-05 6-20

exceed £104-75 but do not
exceed £117-75 3-65 4-80 5-95

exceed £117-75 but do not Plus, where
exceed £130-75 3-40 4-55 5-70 there are

more than
exceed £130-75 but do not two qualified

exceed £143-75 3-15 4-30 5-45 children,
► 75p for each

exceed £143-75 but do not qualified
exceed £156-75 2-90 4-05 5-20 child in

excess of
exceed £156-75 but do not two.

exceed £169-75 2-65 3-80 4-95

exceed £169-75 but do not
exceed £182-75 2-40 3-55 4-70

exceed £182-75 but do not
exceed £195-75 2-15 3-30 4-45

exceed £195-75 but do not
exceed £208-75 1-90 3-05 4-20

exceed £208-75 but do not
exceed £221-75 1-65 2-80 3-95

exceed £221-75 but do not
exceed £234-75 1-40 2-55 3-70

exceed £234-75 but do not
exceed £247-75 115 2-30 3-45

exceed £247-75 but do not
exceed £260-75 0-90 2-05 3-20

exceed £260-75 but do not
exceed £273-75 0-65 1-80 2-95 ^

(2) In the case of a pensioner who has attained the age of 80 
years, the rate of pension payable to him in accordance with the 
Table (inserted by this section) to subsection (2) of the said section 
77 shall be increased by fifty new pence.

5 (3) Section 8 of the Old Age Pensions Act, 1924 (as amended by 1924, no. 19.
the Act of 1971) is hereby amended by the substitution of “two 
hundred and seventy-three pounds ” for “ two hundred and sixty 
pounds ” in subsection (1) (i).

(4) Subsections (7) to (5) of this section shall come into operation
10 on the 4th day of August, 1972.

3



Increase of rates 
of unemployment 
assistance.

1933,|No.£46.

Increase of certain 
rates of 
unemployment 
benefit.

1967, No. 18.

3.—(1) In the Unemployment Assistance Act, 1933, for the 
Schedule thereto (inserted by the Act of 1971) there is hereby sub­
stituted the Schedule to this subsection.

SCHEDULE

RATES OF UNEMPLOYMENT ASSISTANCE

Classes of persons to 
whom the rates of 

unemployment assistance 
set out in this Schedule 

are applicable

Weekly rate of 
unemployment assistance 

applicable to persons 
resident in any urban 

area

Weekly rate of 
unemployment assistance 

applicable to persons 
resident in any other 

place

Person without a depen­
dant ........................... £4-35 £405

Person with an adult 
dependant £7-75 £7-35

Person with an adult 
dependant and one child 
dependant £8-90 £8-50

Person with an adult 
dependant and two or 
more child dependants £1005

plus, where there are 
more than two child 
dependants, 75p for 
each child dependant 

in excess of two.

£9-65
plus, where there are 
more than two child 
dependants, 75p for 
each child dependant 

in excess of two.

Person with one child 
dependant £5-65 £5-35

Person with two or more 
child dependants £6-80

plus, where there are 
more than two child 
dependants, 75p for 
each child dependant 

in excess of two.

£6-50
plus, where there are 
more than two child 
dependants, 75p for 
each child dependant 

in excess of two.

(2) Subsection (1) of this section shall come into operation on the 
2nd day of August, 1972. 5

4.—(1) In the Table to section 5 (2) of the Social Welfare (Miscel­
laneous Provisions) Act, 1967, for the rates set forth therein (inserted 
by the Act of 1971) there are hereby substituted the rates set forth 
in the Table to this subsection.

TABLE

Class of Person Weekly
Rate

Increase 
for adult 

dependant 
(where 

payable)

Increase for 
qualified child 
or for each of 
two qualified 

children 
(where 

payable)

Increase 
for each 
qualified 
child in 

excess of 
two (where 

payable)

(1) (2) (3) (4) (5)

Person entitled to an 
increase in respect of 
a qualified child but 
not entitled to an in­
crease in respect of an 
adult dependant £4-50 £115 £0-75

Any other person £4-35 £3-40 £1*15 £0-75

(2) Subsection (/) of this section shall come into operation on the 10
3rd day of August, 1972.

4



5.—(1) Section 20 (inserted by the Act of 1952) of the Act of 1935 Increase of rates of 
is hereby amended by— widows’ (non­

contributory)
(a) the substitution for subsection (1) (b) (inserted by the Act of pensions.

1971) of the following: "

5

10

15

20

25

“ (b) (i) where the yearly means of the widow as duly 
calculated do not exceed two hundred and 
seventy-three pounds and seventy-five new 
pence, at the rate set forth in Table B to this 
subsection, and

(ii) where the yearly means of the widow as duly 
calculated exceed two hundred and seventy- 
three pounds and seventy-five new pence, at the 
rate at which the pension would be payable if 
the yearly means of the widow as duly calcu­
lated exceeded two hundred and sixty pounds 
and seventy-five new pence but did not exceed 
two hundred and seventy-three pounds and 
seventy-five new pence, less twenty-five new 
pence for each amount (if any) of thirteen 
pounds by which the said yearly means exceed 
two hundred and seventy-three pounds and 
seventy-five new pence, any fraction of thirteen 
pounds being treated for this purpose as 
thirteen pounds; provided that if the rate calcu­
lated pursuant to this paragraph at which, but 
for this provision, the pension would be payable 
is less than fifty new pence a week, the pension 
shall not be payable ”,

(b) the substitution for Table B (inserted by the Act of 1971) 
of the following Table:

TABLE B
Weekly Rates of Widows’ (Non-Contributory) Pensions

Means of Widow

(1)

Widow, 
no qualified 

child

(2)

Widow, 
one qualified 

child

(3)

Widow, 
two qualified 

children

(4)

Where the yearly means of
£ £ £

the widow, as duly cal­
culated—

are Nil........................... 5-15 6-50 7-85'

exceed Nil but do not
exceed £26-25 ..

exceed £26-25 but do not

4-90 6-25 7-60

exceed £52-50 ..

exceed £52-50 but do not

4-65 6-00 7-35

exceed £65-50 .. 4-40 5-75 7-10

exceed £65-50 but do not
exceed £78-50 .. 4-15 5-50 6-85

exceed £78-50 but do not
exceed £104-75 3-90 5-25 6-60

exceed £104-75 but do not
exceed £117-75

exceed £117-75 but do not

3-65 5-00 6-35

Plus, where
exceed £130-75

exceed £130-75 but do not

3-40 4-75 6-10 there are 
more than 
two qualified

exceed £143-75

exceed £143-75 but do not

3-15 4-50 5-85 children, 
£1-35 for 

► each
exceed £156-75

exceed £156-75 but do not

2-90 4-25 5-60 qualified 
child in 
excess of

exceed £169-75 2-65 400 5-35 two.

exceed £169-75 but do not
exceed £182-75 2-40 3-75 5-10



TABLE B—continued.

Increase of rates 
of orphans’ (non­
contributory) 
pensions.

Amendment of 
section 6 of Act 
of 1952.

1960, No. 25.

Weekly Rates of Widows’ (Non-Contributory) Pensions

Means of Widow
Widow, 

no qualified 
child

Widow, 
one qualified 

child

Widow, 
two qualified 

children

(1) (2) (3) (4)

exceed £182-75 but do not 
exceed £195-75 2*15 3-50 4-85

exceed £195-75 but do not 
exceed £208-75 1-90 3-25 4-60

exceed £208-75 but do not 
exceed £221-75 1-65 3 00 4-35

exceed £221-75 but do not 
exceed £234-75 1-40 2-75 4-10

exceed £234-75 but do not 
exceed £247-75 1*15 2-50 3-85

exceed £247-75 but do not 
exceed £260-75 0-90 2-25 3-60

exceed £260-75 but do not 
exceed £273-75 0-65 2-00 3-35.

(2) Subsection (/) of this section shall come into operation, in the 
case of allowances payable by virtue of section 22 of the Act of 1970, 
on the 3rd day of August, 1972, and, in all other cases, on the 4th 
day of August, 1972.

6.—(1) For the Table (inserted by the Act of 1971) to section 25 5 
(inserted by the Act of 1952) of the Act of 1935 there is hereby 
inserted the Table to this subsection.

TABLE

Weekly Rates of Orphans’ (Non-Contributory) Pensions

Means of Orphan Weekly rates

Where the yearly means of the orphan as duly calculated—

do not exceed £23-40 ................................................................ £3-00
exceed £23-40 but do not exceed £46-80 ........................... £2-55
exceed £46-80 but do not exceed £70-20 ........................... £2-10
exceed £70-20 but do not exceed £93-60 ........................... £1-65
exceed £93-60 but do not exceed £117-00 ........................... £1-20
exceed £117-00 but do not exceed £140-40 ........................... £0-75
exceed £140-40 ............................................................................ No pension

(2) Subsection (7) of this section shall come into operation on 
the 4th day of August, 1972.

7.—(1) Section 6 (2) (inserted by the Social Welfare (Amendment) 10 
Act, 1960) of the Act of 1952 is hereby amended by the substitution 
for the rate of voluntary contribution set forth in each paragraph 
mentioned in column (1) of the Table to this subsection of the rate 
set forth, opposite the mention of that paragraph in the said column
(1), in column (2) of that Table. 15

TABLE

Paragraph of Section 6 (2) Rate of Contribution
(1) (2)

Paragraph (a)....................................... 44p

Paragraph (b)....................................... £1-08

(2) Subsection (7) of this section shall come into operation on the
2nd day of October, 1972.

6



8.—(1) Subsection (4) (inserted by the Act of 1968) of section 26 
of the Act of 1952 is hereby amended by—

(a) the substitution for paragraph (a) of the following para­
graph :

5 “ (a) The weekly rate of old age (contributory) pension and, in
the case of a person who has attained the age of 70 years, 
of widow’s (contributory) pension, retirement pension or 
invalidity pension shall be increased by the amount set 
out in column (6) of Part I of the Third Schedule to 

10 this Act for any period during which—

(i) the beneficiary is so incapacitated as to require full­
time care and attention,

(ii) there is residing with the beneficiary for the purpose
of providing that care and attention a prescribed 

15 relative of the beneficiary, and

(iii) such conditions as may be prescribed are fulfilled.”,
and

(b) the deletion of “ female ” in paragraph (b).

(2) Subsection (7) of this section shall come into operation on the 
20 5th day of October, 1972.

9.—Section 47 of the Act of 1952 is hereby amended by the 
substitution for paragraph (aa) (inserted by the Social Welfare 
(Miscellaneous Provisions) Act, 1963) of the following paragraph:

“ (aa) where it appears to the Minister that the circumstances so 
25 warrant, for enabling a person to be appointed to receive

and deal with, on behalf of a claimant or beneficiary—

(i) in respect of disability benefit, unemployment benefit,
invalidity pension, retirement pension or old age 
(contributory) pension, so much of the benefit or 

30 pension as is payable by virtue of section 26 or
section 27 of this Act,

(ii) in respect of widow’s (contributory) pension, so much
of the pension as is payable by virtue of section 27 
of this Act,

35 (iii) in respect of injury benefit or disablement pension, so
much thereof as is payable by virtue of section 10 
or section 11 of the Social Welfare (Occupational 
Injuries) Act, 1966.”.

10.—Section 58 of the Act of 1952 is hereby amended by the 
40 substitution of “ twelve months ” for “ four months ” in subsection 

(3).

11.-—(1) Section 77 (5) (inserted by the Act of 1969) of the Act of 
1952 is hereby amended by the deletion of "female” in paragraphs
(a) (ii) and (b).

45 (2) Subsection (7) of this section shall come into operation on the
6th day of October, 1972.

«
12.—(1) The Second Schedule to the Act of 1952 is hereby 

amended by the substitution, for the rate of contribution set forth in 
each paragraph mentioned in column (I) of the Table to this sub-

Amendment of 
section 26 (4) 
of Act of 1952.

Amendment of 
section 47 of 
Act of 1952.
1963, No. 26.

Amendment of 
section 58 of 
Act of 1952.

Amendment of 
section 77 (5) of 
Act of 1952.

Amendment of 
Second Schedule 
to Act of 1952.

7



Amendment of 
Third Schedule to 
Act of 1952.

section, of the rate set forth opposite the mention of that paragraph 
in the said column (1), in column (2) of that Table.

TABLE

Paragraph of Second Schedule 
(1)

Rate of 
Contribution 

(2)

Paragraph 1 (a):
£

(i) in the case of a male employed contributor 103
(ii) in the case of a female employed contributor 0-97

Paragraph 1 (b):
(i) in the case of a male employed contributor 109
(ii) in the case of a female employed contributor 107

Paragraph 2(a) ............................................................................. 0-91
Paragraph 2(b) ............................................................................ 0-95
Paragraph 2 A (a)............................................................................ 0-77
Paragraph 2 A (b)............................................................................ 0-90
Paragraph 3 (a) ............................................................................. 0-72
Paragraph 3 (b) ............................................................................. 0-79
Paragraph 3A (a) ............................................................................. 0-82
Paragraph 3A (b) ............................................................................. 0-95
Paragraph 4 (0) ............................................................................. 0-21
Paragraph 4(b) .. ....................................................................... 0-23
Paragraph 5 (b) ............................................................................. 0-23
Paragraph 6(a) ............................................................................ 0-94
Paragraph 6(b) ............................................................................. 107
Paragraph 7 (a) ............................................................................ 0-94
Paragraph 1(b) ............................................................................. 102

(2) Subsection (7) of this section shall come into operation on the 
2nd day of October, 1972.

13.—(1) The Third Schedule to the Act of 1952 is hereby amended 5
r___

(a) the substitution for Part I (inserted by the Act of 1971) of 
the following Part:

“PART I
Rates of Periodical Benefits and of Increases Thereof

Description of benefit

(1)

Weekly
Rate

(2)

Increase 
for adult 

dependant 
(where 

payable)

(3)

Increase
for

qualified 
child or 
for each 
of two 

qualified 
children 
(where 

payable) 
(4)

Increase 
for each 
qualified 
child in 
excess of

two
(where

payable)

(5)

Increase 
for adult 

dependant 
under 

section 
26(4) 
(where 

payable)

(6)

1. Disability Benefit and Unemployment 
Benefit:

£ £ £ £ £

(a) in the case of persons over the age 
of eighteen—

(i) for a man, single woman or 
widow, married woman living 
apart from and unable to 
obtain any financial assistance 
from her husband or married 
woman entitled to an increase 
for a qualified child or qualified 
children or for a husband 5-55 3-75 1-33 1 00

(ii) for any other married woman 4-35 — — — —

(6) in the case of persons under the 
age of eighteen—

(i) where the person is entitled to 
an increase for a qualified child 
or qualified children or for an 
aduk dependant 5-55 3-75 1-35 100

(ii) where the person is not so 
entitled .. 4-35 — — — —

2. Invalidity Pension.......................... 5-55 3-75 1-33 100 300



“ PART I—(continued)
Rates of Periodical Benefits and of Increases Thereof

Description of benefit

(1)

Weekly
Rate

(2)

Increase 
for adult 

dependant 
(where 

payable)

(3)

Increase
for

qualified 
child or 
for each 
of two 

qualified 
children 
(where 

payable) 
(4)

Increase 
for each 
qualified 
child in 

excess of
two

(where
payable)

(5)

Increase 
for adult 

dependant 
under 
section 
26(4) 
(where 

payable)

(6)

£ £ £ £ £

3. Maternity Allowance 5-55 - — — —

4. Widow’s (Contributory) Pension:

(a) in the case of persons under the 
age of eighty ......................... 5 60 — 1 50 1-50 300

(b) in any other case . . 6 10 — 1-50 1-50 3-00

3. Orphan's (Contributory) Allowance 3 80 — — — -

6. Retirement Pension and Old Age 
(Contributory) Pension:

(a) in the case of persons under the 
age of eighty 6-20 4 15 1-35 1 00 3-00

(6) in any other case . 6-70 4 15 1-35 1 00 3-00

and

• (h) the substitution in Part II (inserted by the Social Welfare 1965, No. 20.
(Miscellaneous Provisions) Act, 1965), for the item inserted 
by the Act of 1970, of the following item:

5 “ 3. Death Grant:
(a) in case the deceased person was a qualified

child under the age of five years ... 7
(b) in case the deceased person was any

other qualified child ...........................21
JO (c) in any other case ...........................35 ”.

(2) Subsection (/) of this section shall come into operation—
(a) in so far as it relates to disability benefit, unemployment 

benefit, maternity allowance and death grant, on the 2nd 
day of October, 1972,

15 (b) in so far as it relates to invalidity pension and retirement
pension, on the 5th day of October, 1972, and

(c) in so far as it relates to any other benefit, on the 6th day of 
October, 1972.

14.—The Fourth Schedule to the Act of 1952 is hereby amended Amendment of
20 by the substitution of the following for paragraph 3 (b) (ii): Fourth Schedule

to Act of 1952.

“ (ii) that not less than twenty-six employment contributions have 
been paid in respect of or credited to the claimant in 
respect of the last complete contribution year before the 
beginning of the benefit year in which the relevant time 

25 occurs or in respect of a subsequent complete contribution
year before the relevant time.”.

15.—(1) The Act of 1952 is hereby amended by— Amendments
relating to the

(a) the insertion after paragraph 10 (inserted by the Social erov^s!ons°ofAct,n 
Welfare (Insurance Inclusions and Exclusions) Regula- of 1952 to membe

of Garda Siochina.
9



1966. No. 16.

Restriction of 
section 13 of Act 
of 1966 and of 
certain regulations 
under section 32 
of Act of 1952.

Amendment of 
Social Welfare 
(Occupational 
Injuries) Act, 1966.

tions, 1968 (S.I. No. 51 of 1968)) of Part I of the First 
Schedule of the following paragraph:

“11. Employment as a member of the Garda Siochdna. ” ,

and
(b) the insertion in section 12 (1) after subparagraph (g) (inserted 5 

by the Act of 1968) of the following:

“ or
(h) persons employed as members of the Garda 

Sfochana.”.

(2) Section 3 (3) of the Social Welfare (Occupational Injuries) Act, io 
1966, is hereby amended by the insertion after subparagraph (d) of 
the following:

“ (e) employment as a member of the Garda Si'ochina.”.

(3) This section shall come into operation on such date as the
Minister by order appoints for that purpose. 15

16.—(1) Section 13 of the Act of 1966 shall not during the relevant 
period operate to permit a person to receive a non-contributory old 
age pension in respect of that period or any part thereof solely be­
cause, by virtue of the increases in the rates of such pension under 
section 2 of this Act, the rate of such pension payable to that person 20 
would be greater than the rate of old age (contributory) pension or 
widow’s (contributory) pension to which that person is entitled, or 
greater than the rate of increase of old age (contributory) pension 
payable in respect of that person.

(2) The regulations made under section 32 of the Act of 1952 (as 25 
amended by section 7 of the Act of 1966) and for the time being in 
force shall not during the relevant period operate to permit a widow
to receive a widow’s (non-contributory) pension in respect of that 
period or any part thereof solely because, by virtue of the increases 
in the rates of such pension under section 5 of this Act, the rate of 30 
such pension payable to her would be greater than the rate of widow’s 
(contributory) pension payable to her.

(3) In this section “ the relevant period ” means the period com­
mencing on the 4th day of August, 1972, and ending on the 5th day 
of October, 1972.

17.—(1) The Social Welfare (Occupational Injuries) Act, 1966, is 
hereby amended as follows:

(a) in section 8 (3) (a) “ six pounds and ten new pence ” shall be
substituted for “ five pounds and fifty new pence ” 
(inserted by the Act of 1971), 40

(b) in section 8 (3) (b) “ eight pounds and ten new pence ” shall
be substituted for “ seven pounds and fifty new pence ” 
(inserted by the Act of 1971),

(c) in section 9 (7) (a) “ five hundred and sixty-eight pounds ”
shall be substituted for “ five hundred and twenty pounds ” 45 
(inserted by the Act of 1971),

(d) in TABLE I annexed to section 9 (8) “£8.10” shall be
substituted for “ £7.50 ”, “ £7.29 ” for “ £6.75 ”, “ £6 48 ” 
for “ £6 ”, “£5.67” for “£5.25”, “£4.86” for “£4.50”, 
“£4.05” for “£3.75”, “£3.24” for “£3”, “£2.43” for 50 
“ £2.25 ” and “ £1.62 ” for “ £1.50 ” (inserted by the Act 
of 1971),

(e) in TABLE II annexed to section 9 (8) “£6.10” shall be
substituted for “ £5.50 ”, “ £5.49 ” for “ £4.95 ”, “ £4.88 ”

10



for “ £4.40 ”, “ £4.27 ” for ‘‘ £3.85 ”, “ £3.66 ” for “ £3.30 ”, 
“£3.05” for “£2.75”, “£2.44” for “£2.20”, “£1.83” 
for “£1.65” and “£1.22” for “£1.10” (inserted by the 
Act of 1971),

5 (/) in section 9 (9) (b) (ii) “£1.62” shall be substituted for
“ £1.50 ” and “ £1.22 ” for “ £1.10 ” (inserted by the Act 
of 1971),

(g) in section 10(1) “ three pounds and seventy-five new pence ”
shall be substituted for “ three pounds and forty-five new 

10 pence ” (inserted by the Act of 1971),

(h) in section 11 (1), “one pound and thirty-five new pence”
shall be substituted for “ eighteen shillings ” (inserted by 
the Act of 1970) and “ one pound ” shall be substituted 
for “ thirteen shillings ” (inserted by the Act of 1970),

15 (0 in section 12 (1) (a) “ four pounds and thirty-five new pence ”
shall be substituted for “ three pounds and ninety new 
pence ” (inserted by the Act of 1971),

O') in section 12 (1) (6) “ five pounds and fifty-five new pence ” 
shall be substituted for “ four pounds and ninety-five 

20 new pence ” (inserted by the Act of 1971),

(A) in section 13 (1) “£3” shall be substituted for “£2.75” 
(inserted by the Act of 1971),

(/) in section 15 (1) (a) (i) “ six pounds and ten new pence ” 
shall be substituted for “ five pounds and fifty new pence ” 

25 (inserted by the Act of 1971),

(m) in section 15 (1) (a) (ii) “ eight pounds and ten new pence ”
shall be substituted for “ seven pounds and fifty new 
pence ” (inserted by the Act of 1971),

(n) in sections 17 (2) and 18 (2) “ seven pounds and sixty new
30 pence ” shall be substituted for “ seven pounds ”

(inserted by the Act of 1971),

(o) in section 18 (3) “three hundred and ninety-five pounds”
shall be substituted for “ three hundred and sixty-five
pounds ” (inserted by the Act of 1971),

. *
35 (p) in section 19 “ one pound and fifty new pence ” shall be

substituted for “ one pound ” (inserted by the Act of 
1971) in each place where it occurs,

iq) in section 20 “ two pounds and eighty new pence ” shall be 
substituted for “ two pounds and fifty new pence ” (in- 

40 serted by the Act of 1971) in each place where it occurs
and “ seven pounds and sixty new pence ” shall be 
substituted for “ seven pounds ” (inserted by the Act of 
1971) in each place where it occurs,

(r) in section 21 (2) “ four pounds and ten new pence ” shall 
45 be substituted for “ three pounds and sixty new pence ”

(inserted by the Act of 1971),

(5) in section 22 “ one hundred pounds ” shall be substituted 
for “ sixty pounds ” (inserted by the Act of 1971) in each 
place where it occurs,

50 (/) in section 25 (3) (a) “ one pound and twenty-two new pence ”
shall be substituted for “ one pound and ten new pence ” 
(inserted by the Act of 1971),

(u) in section 25 (3) (b) “ one pound and sixty-two new pence ” 
shall be substituted for “ one pound and fifty new pence ” 
finserted by the Act of 1971).

11



Amendment of 
section 21 (1) 
of Act of 1970.

(2) Subsection (/) of this section shall come into operation on the
2nd day of October, 1972.

18.—Section 21 (1) of the Act of 1970 is hereby amended—

(a) by the substitution, with effect from the 3rd day of August,
1972, of “ £3 ” for “ £2 15s. Od.” and, in paragraph (d), 5 
of “ £351.75 ” for “ £299. 15s”, and

(ib) by the deletion, with effect from the 5th day of October, 1972, 
of “ female ” in paragraph (b).

Amendment of 
section 22 (1) 
of Act of 1970.

19.—(1) Section 22 (1) of the Act of 1970 is hereby amended by 
the substitution of “ forty years of age ” for “ fifty years of age ” in 10 
paragraph (c).

(2) Subsection (7) of this section shall come into operation on the
3rd day of August, 1972.

Short title, 
construction and 
collective citation.

20.—(1) This Act may be cited as the Social Welfare Act, 1972.
15

(2) This Act—
(a) in so far as it amends and extends the Old Age Pensions

Acts, 1908 to 1971, shall be construed as one with those 
Acts and may be cited together with them as the Old Age 
Pensions Acts, 1908 to 1972,

(b) in so far as it amends and extends the Unemployment 20
Assistance Acts, 1933 to 1971, shall be construed as one 
with those Acts and may be cited together with them as the 
Unemployment Assistance Acts, 1933 to 1972,

(c) in so far as it amends and extends the Widows’ and Orphans’
Pensions Acts, 1935 to 1971, shall be construed as one 25 
with those Acts and may be cited together with them as 
the Widows’ and Orphans’ Pensions Acts, 1935 to 1972,

(d) in so far as it amends and extends the Social Welfare Acts,
1952 to 1971, shall be construed as one with those Acts 
and may be cited together with them as the Social Welfare 30 
Acts, 1952 to 1972.

r



=

.



AN BILLE LEAS A SHOISIALAIGH, 1972 SOCIAL WELFARE BILL, 1972

BILLE
(mar a tugadh isteach) 

da ngairtear

Acht do leasu agus do leathnu Achtanna na 
bPinsean Seanaoise, 1908 go 1971, na nAcht- 
anna um Chunamh Difhostaiochta, 1933 go 
1971, na nAchtanna um Pinsin do Bhain- 
treacha agus do Dhilleachtai, 1935 go 1971, 
agus na nAchtanna Leasa Shoisialaigh, 1952 
go 1971.

An tAire Leasa Shoisialaigh a thug isteach

Ordaiodh ag Dail Lireann a chlobhualadh, 
21 Meitheamh, 1972

BAILE ATHA CLLATH :
ARNA FHOILSltT AO OIFIG AN tSOLATHAIR

Le oeannach direach 6n Oifig Diolta Foilseach&n Rialtais, 
An Stuara, Ard-Oifig an Phoist, Bade Atha Cliath, n6 tri 

aon dioltdir leabhar.

C16bhuailte ag Cahill & Co. Ltd.

7iP

BILL
(as introduced) 

entitled

An Act to amend and extend the Old Age 
Pensions Acts, 1908 to 1971, the Unemploy­
ment Assistance Acts, 1933 to 1971, the 
Widows’ and Orphans’ Pensions Acts, 1935 
to 1971, and the Social Welfare Acts, 1952 
to 1971.

Introduced by the Minister for Social Welfare

Ordered by Dail Lireann to be printed, 
21 st June, 1972

DUBLIN :
PUBLISHED BY THE STATIONERY OFFICE

To be purchased through any booksoller, or directly from 
the Government Publications Salo Office,

G.P.O. Arcade, Dublin.

Printed by Cahill & Co. Ltd.

7iP

Wt. W68890/G/3. 875. 6/72. C.&Co. (6486). G.16.


